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CHAPTER 1. INTRODUCTION: ABOUT OUR CAPSTONE
PROJECT

1. PROJECT OVERVIEW

1.1. Project Introduction
The Communication Campaign for Better Life Organization, aimed at enhancing the brand
awareness of BeLi English and Bstudy, is a project spearheaded by the VIVA team—a group of
accomplished final-year students majoring in Multimedia Communication at FPT University.
Spanning from July 27, 2023, to December 15, 2023 This project is a testament to the team's
dedication and experience in the field. The client for this initiative is Mr. Nguyen Trung Hieu,
the founder of Better Life Organization.



Viva Team and Mr. Hieu as our client

The central concept driving this project is the establishment of brand identity uniformity among
online media platforms for the main subsidiary companies, BeLi English and Bstudy, under the
mother organization known as Better Life. This initiative aims to bring cohesion and consistency
to the visual and conceptual aspects of both brands. This strategic endeavor involves aligning
various elements, such as logos, color schemes, content style, and design elements, to create a
seamless and harmonized identity.

The primary focus of the project revolves around the development and fortification of the
organization's communication products and activities. With a keen eye on the intricacies of
multimedia communication, the VIVA team is committed to crafting compelling narratives that
resonate with the target audience. The multifaceted nature of this undertaking encompasses
optimizing the brand identity of BeLi English and Bstudy, two integral subsidiaries of Better Life
Organization.



Better Life Organization

Moreover, the team is also set to contribute significantly to the overarching goal of elevating the
brand image recognition of BeLi English and Bstudy. In the pursuit of elevating Better Life
Organization's brand identity, a long-term content strategy has been devised. The first facet
involves a visual transformation, beginning with the development of a distinctive new logo, new
website interface of BeLi English and new mascot of Bstudy, aiming to establish a memorable
and recognizable visual identity. This is complemented by a revision of the color palette,
strategically revamped to evoke a sense of professionalism and ensure consistency across all
branding elements.

Through a combination of diverse multimedia elements and strategic communication activities,
the VIVA team aspires to propel Better Life Organization to long-term targets and provide
positive benefits for the society.

- Long-term benefits to Better Life: Maintain a clear and consistent brand identity to build
connection and trust with audiences and stakeholders. From there, corporate culture shall
be shaped more clearly, in a direct and indirect way.

- Long-term benefits to society: Evoke the interest in learning and teaching for students
and teachers. Hence, trigger them to find suitable teaching and learning methods.

The results of the Better Life communication campaign reflect a resounding success across
various key performance indicators for both BeLi English and Bstudy. On Facebook, BeLi
English achieved remarkable increases in reach (124.43%), interactions (134.29%), new page



likes (162.2%), and visits (133.68%), indicating a significant improvement in audience
engagement and brand visibility. The website performance also exhibited substantial growth,
with a keyword engine search volume increase of 131.11%, a visit increase of 129%, and a
noteworthy visit duration increase of 134.48%.

In the realm of TV commercials (TVC), BeLi English achieved a solid reach of 101.8%, and
interactions surged by 110%, showcasing a highly engaging and interactive TVC component of
the campaign.

Similarly, Bstudy witnessed notable improvements in Facebook metrics, with a reach increase of
130.93%, interactions increasing by 125%, and new Facebook page likes growing by 160.6%.
The campaign's impact extended to Instagram, where Bstudy experienced a reach growth of
123.58%, interactions increased by 112%, and new followers saw a positive uptick of 102.6%.
These outcomes underscore the comprehensive success of the communication campaign in
bolstering online presence and engagement across multiple social media platforms.

1.2. Reasons for Undertaking The Project
The decision to undertake this project is grounded in the unique suitability of the VIVA team to
fulfill its objectives. As a group of final-year students specializing in Multimedia
Communication at FPT University, the VIVA team brings a diverse skill set, fresh perspectives,
and a comprehensive understanding of contemporary communication strategies. Our academic
background, coupled with our creative and innovative approach, makes us well-equipped to
tackle the challenges of enhancing the brand awareness of BeLi English and Bstudy under the
Better Life Organization.

Better Life distinguishes itself by integrating the technology (Bstudy) with the English training
program (BeLi English Center), which utilizes international textbooks of high standards, widely
recognized in major English systems. Additionally, with a teaching staff comprising 100%
university degree holders, possessing international teaching certificates such as TEFL, TESOL,
and TKT of BeLi English and with the initiative technology of the application Bstudy, Better
Life ensures a high-quality educational experience (BeLi English, 2023). However, despite these
strengths, the brand still faces challenges in establishing a robust presence within the Vietnamese
public due to limitations in current communication strategies. The online media platforms
interactions are suboptimal, and there exists competition from other pages with higher quality
and more established reputations. Fragmented, inconsistent content on the communication
content coupled with subpar quality in images and colors contribute to a perceived lack of
professionalism and customer attraction. (See Appendix 1)

To address these shortcomings, Viva Team is committed to a strategic overhaul. The focus will
be on elevating the brand identity of 2 facebook pages (BeLi & Bstudy); building an instagram



account (Bstudy); developing mascot for Bstudy and redesigning BeLi English website,
delivering creative, interesting, and high-quality content that resonates with the audience.
Specific target audiences for each channel will be thoroughly reviewed, allowing for the
formulation of precise communication strategies tailored to the right customers.

For the VIVA team themselves, this project serves as a valuable learning experience, providing
practical insights into real-world communication challenges and solutions. It contributes to the
team's professional development, leaving them with a portfolio showcasing their capabilities in
executing a comprehensive communication campaign.

The legacy extends to the clients, Mr. Nguyen Trung Hieu, and the Better Life Organization. The
project aims to optimize communication products and activities, thereby creating a lasting
positive impression on the brand identity of BeLi English and Bstudy. Moreover, the impact on
the target audience is significant, fostering increased awareness and engagement with the
educational offerings of BeLi English and Bstudy.

By optimizing the brand identity and communication activities of organizations dedicated to
education and better living, the project contributes to the broader societal goal of promoting
accessible and quality education. The legacy is not just about immediate gains but underscores a
commitment to making a positive and lasting contribution to the community and society as a
whole.

Viva Team envisions that this project will transform the social media networks of Better Life’s
two main components i.e. Bstudy and BeLi English into trustworthy hubs and the preferred
choice for customers seeking English education for those who want to learn English in the
suburbs of the city. The objective is not just to enhance brand awareness but to establish BeLi
English as a beacon of quality and innovation in the field of language education.

1.3. Client Brief and Our Proposal
Recognizing the evolving demands of language learners, especially in the realm of English
language proficiency in Vietnamese suburban areas (An Binh, 2023), Mr. Hieu as the CEO of the
organization aims to implement a robust communication campaign for BeLi English and Bstudy,
aligning with the Better Life Organization's mission to provide accessible and impactful
education. With a focus on creative solutions and a keen emphasis on positive impact, the client
aims to position BeLi English and Bstudy as quality, practical learning platforms with a
reasonable price.

Better Life Organization, encompassing BeLi English and Bstudy. The primary goal is to
enhance content appeal on owned media channels while fostering synergy between BeLi English



and Bstudy. BeLi targets English learners aged 3 to 40, while Bstudy aims to refine its brand
identity and engage educational institutions, language centers, and instructors.

Client Brief

In essence, the client brief underscores a holistic approach to education, combining innovation,
accessibility, and positive impact, with the ultimate goal of establishing BeLi English and Bstudy
as influential players in the educational landscape.

According to the brief of our client, Viva Team proposes a strategic overhaul under the project to
enhance brand identity, content quality, and customer engagement.







1.4. Our Roles In The Project
The Viva Team acts as the company's Media team leading the project. Our team, composed of
five members specializing in Multimedia Communication Management, plays a pivotal role in
reshaping the brand identities of BeLi English and Bstudy. Each team member brings a unique
set of skills and passion for effective communication, ensuring a comprehensive and strategic
approach to the project. As the Viva Team progresses through the project's phases, our
collaborative efforts are geared towards achieving measurable growth and efficiency. By setting
specific metrics and targets, the team aims not only to enhance brand awareness but also to
establish BeLi English and Bstudy as trusted for English education in their respective domains.
The team's dedication, skills, and strategic mindset are the driving forces behind the success of
this communication campaign.



2. COMPANY OVERVIEW
2.1. About Better Life

Better Life, founded by an esteemed FPT alumni, is an organization at the forefront of
educational innovation. With a strong commitment to shaping the future of English learning, the
institution stands as a long-standing excellence in the field. Better Life prides itself on offering a
diverse range of products that cater to various needs of learning English. The organization
understands the unique requirements of learners and has developed a portfolio of brands aimed at
education and management software. This approach ensures that individuals can find tailored
solutions to enhance their language learning journey. The institution's commitment to providing
quality, practical learning experiences, making education enjoyable and accessible aligns with its
overarching goal of "Better English - Better Life" (BeLi English, 2023).



2.1.1. Vision
Better Life Organization aspires to secure the top position as the leading enterprise in the
intersection of education and technology within Vietnam. This vision underscores a commitment
to not only excel in the business realm but also to make a significant impact on the educational
landscape of the country (BeLi English, 2023). The vision effectively communicates the
institution's aspirational goal, reinforcing the school's commitment to life-changing language
education.

2.1.2. Mission
The central mission of Better Life Organization is to elevate the standards of Vietnamese
education. This mission aligns with a broader societal goal, reflecting a dedication to
contributing positively to the educational development of the nation. Better Life's mission
emphasizes transformative language education that fosters personal growth, effective
communication, and global opportunities. The mention of a vibrant and inclusive learning
community aligns with the commitment to making learning enjoyable and comfortable, as stated
in the slogan - “Better English - Better Life” (BeLi English, 2023).

2.1.3. Core Values
The slogan, "Better English - Better Life," encapsulates the overarching mission of Better Life
Organization. It effectively communicates the value proposition of the institution, emphasizing
the positive impact of English proficiency on overall life experiences. The association of Better
Life Organization as a brand recognized for quality, practical learning, and affordability is
well-reflected in the slogan.

The core values—Excellence, Affordability, Inclusivity, Empowerment, Innovation,
Collaboration, Integrity, Continuous Learning, and Community Engagement—provide a robust
framework for the institution's culture. These values align closely with the emphasis on quality,
practicality, and accessibility stated in the slogan. The commitment to community engagement
resonates well with the institution's societal responsibility (BeLi English, 2023).

- High Technology Application: Better Life Organization places a strong emphasis on the
application of high technology across its various business domains. This core value
signifies a commitment to leveraging technological advancements to enhance the quality
and effectiveness of educational services.

- Personnel Dedication to Customers, Passionate about Work: The core values highlight the
pivotal role of personnel in the organization. Employees are expected to demonstrate
unwavering dedication to customer satisfaction and a passion for their work. This
emphasis on personal attributes aligns with the organization's commitment to excellence.

2.1.4. Business Orientation
At Better Life Organization, the business orientation revolves around innovation, expansion, and
creating transformative educational experiences. Their strategic goals for 2023 reflect the



commitment to pushing boundaries and redefining language education. Mr. Hugh Nguyen, the
founder of Better Life Organization, has outlined a comprehensive and ambitious set of goals for
2023.

2023 Goals of Better Life

- English Training Center - BeLi English: Better Life Organization operates BeLi English,
a prominent English training center. This business area reflects the organization's
commitment to language education, aiming to empower individuals with English
proficiency.



Old Logo BeLi English

- Supply of Human Resources for Bteacher English Teachers: The organization engages in
the supply of human resources specifically for Bteacher English teachers. This business
area signifies a commitment to not only educating students but also ensuring the
availability of qualified and dedicated educators.

- Technology Platform for Teaching and Learning all Bstudy app: Better Life Organization
ventures into the technology realm with a dedicated platform for teaching and learning
across various subjects. This aligns with the organization's core value of high technology
application, emphasizing the integration of technology into the educational process.

Logo Bstudy

- BSM Middle Management Software: The organization provides BSM middle
management software, indicating a foray into the technological infrastructure that
supports effective educational administration. This diversification aligns with the
organization's vision to be a leader in both education and technology.



2.2. Beli English As a Subsidiary Company
2.2.1. Vision

BeLi English aspires to be a leading institution in the English education landscape. The center
commits to upholding a reputation for quality, ensuring affordability, delivering clear educational
outcomes, and fostering a fun and diverse learning environment (BeLi English, 2023). The
emphasis on language mastery aligns with the institution's role in equipping students with a tool
for global communication and understanding.

2.2.2. Mission

BeLi English's mission statement, "At BeLi English, we don't just teach English; we empower
futures, equipping our students with the language skills and global perspectives needed to thrive
in an interconnected world," encapsulates the institution's purpose (BeLi English, 2023). The
mission emphasizes empowerment, language skills, and a global perspective, portraying a
holistic approach to education.

- Quality Assurance: The core value of academic excellence underscores BeLi's
commitment to maintaining high educational standards (BeLi English, 2023).

- Global Recognition: Embracing international standards in teaching and pronunciation
positions BeLi English as a globally recognized institution (BeLi English, 2023).

- Adaptability: The emphasis on modern teaching methods and fostering critical thinking
skills signals a commitment to adaptability and staying current with educational trends
(Bouchrika, 2021).

2.2.3. Core Values

BeLi English Center is driven by a set of core values that embody its dedication to providing
top-tier education. These values form the foundation of the center's philosophy, shaping its
approach to teaching and fostering the holistic development of its students (BeLi English, 2023).



2.2.4. Business Strategies

BeLi English Center strategically positions itself in the competitive education sector through a
comprehensive set of business strategies. The success and sustainability of the center are
underpinned by a multifaceted approach, focusing on quality education, teacher excellence,
student and parent satisfaction, program diversity, technological integration, brand building, and
strategic collaborations.







2.3. Bstudy As a Subsidiary Company
2.3.1. Vision

Bstudy aspires to construct a versatile and inclusive educational community, accommodating
diverse learning styles. The vision fosters innovation and positivity, departing from traditional
educational norms, aiming to create a stimulating learning environment. By building a
comprehensive educational platform, Bstudy not only provides content but empowers teachers to
optimize the English language teaching process. (Bstudy, 2023).

2.3.2. Mission

Bstudy's mission reflects a dedicated commitment to revolutionizing the landscape of education,
with a particular focus on English language learning and teaching. The mission is intricately
designed to encapsulate multifaceted objectives aimed at leveraging technology to enhance
educational quality while providing robust support to both educators and learners. Central to
Bstudy's mission is the establishment of a comprehensive educational platform, a hub designed
to offer intelligent, effective, and accessible tools and resources. This platform serves the dual
purpose of empowering teachers to craft diverse and optimal teaching experiences, thus
optimizing the English language teaching process. (Bstudy, 2023).

2.3.3. Core Values

Bstudy, as a pioneering educational platform, stands firmly on a foundation of four core values
that reflect its unwavering dedication to quality education and personal development. These
values encompass a holistic approach to learning and teaching, ensuring a positive and enriching
experience for both educators and learners (Bstudy, 2023).

2.3.4. Business Strategies

Bstudy's business campaign is strategically designed to ensure success and sustainable
development. The multifaceted approach encompasses marketing and promotion, audience
expansion, and international growth. Bstudy's current business strategy focuses on two target
markets. Bstudy's business strategy involves initially targeting B-B users, such as schools,
English training centers, and teachers, and then expanding its reach to B-C customers,
encompassing students and working individuals. By considering the app as a versatile tool and
aiming to expand its presence internationally, Bstudy seeks to provide effective language
learning solutions across various educational contexts.





CHAPTER 2. RESEARCH AND INSIGHTS

1. SECONDARY RESEARCH AS THE MAIN RESEARCH
APPROACH

Like other media projects, our team conducted research using both secondary research methods
and primary research methods. With the primary method, the team conducted research by going
directly to companies considered BeLi's competitors to find out information about the
curriculum, costs, and how they communicate directly to customers. However, it must be said
that secondary research is the type of research our team uses the most, based on documents
provided by customers and by media materials searched on the internet.

Secondary research involves the collection, analysis, and synthesis of data that has been
previously gathered by others (Alchemer, 2018). This approach proves to be valuable for several
reasons.

Firstly, secondary research is recognized for its cost-effectiveness and time-efficiency
(Alchemer, 2018). In contrast to primary research, which demands the allocation of resources to
reach a sufficiently large sample size, secondary research leverages existing data sets and studies,
reducing both financial and temporal investments. This aspect aligns with the project's
constraints in terms of budget and timeline, making secondary research a pragmatic choice.

1.1. Data Collection and Analysis
Conducting large-scale primary research, especially in a diverse and expansive context such as
Vietnam, can be logistically challenging and resource-intensive (Bouchrika, 2021). Given these
limitations, relying on the wealth of information already compiled by other researchers with
substantial sample sizes becomes a practical alternative. Secondary research enables the project
to tap into a broad spectrum of knowledge and insights without the need for extensive data
collection efforts.

To conduct research for the communication campaign, data was collected from various internal
organizations, published scientific research articles, graduation thesis reports, survey reports
from large organizations, textbooks, and news from official newspapers.



In essence, the decision to employ secondary research methodology stems from a strategic
consideration of optimizing resources while still ensuring access to reliable and pertinent
information. By utilizing data from these sources, the research for the communication campaign
would have been comprehensive, incorporating internal knowledge, external research, and
industry insights. This data-driven approach would ensure a well-informed and effective
communication strategy for implementing the project. This approach aligns with the project's
overarching goal of executing a comprehensive and well-informed Communication Campaign
within the specified constraints.



1.2. Case Study Analysis
The secondary research approach extends to the examination of Case Studies, offering real-world
examples of successful communication campaigns within the education sector or similar
domains. Analyzing case studies provides valuable insights into best practices, challenges faced,
and innovative strategies employed by organizations with comparable objectives (Priya, 2020).

The case study method stands as a cornerstone in the realm of social research, offering a
comprehensive and in-depth exploration of various dimensions (Priya, 2020). Understanding the
dynamics, methodologies, and outcomes of similar campaigns contributes to the formulation of a
well-informed and strategic communication plan for Better Life Organization. It enables the
identification of effective communication channels, messaging strategies, and engagement tactics
that align with the unique goals of the project.

In summary, through a combination of comprehensive data analysis and in-depth case study
examination, the research team aims to craft a communication campaign that is not only
informed but also strategically positioned for success.

1.2.1. Apollo English Case Study

Apollo Vietnam Education and Training Organization, guided by the profound belief that
"Learning is a powerful door to help make life better". This mission seeks to "train the young
generation of Vietnam to become global citizens, promoting individual prosperity and
contributing to the positive development of the country and the world" (Nguyen, 2023).

Apollo English strategically positions itself as a leading provider of English courses for children
aged 3-16, offering both face-to-face and online learning options. The organization strives to
provide a unique learning experience for its students, emphasizing a commitment to continuous
improvement with the slogan "Where the best becomes better." They want to convey the message
that in their learning environment, excellence can always evolve further (Nguyen, 2023; Brand
Dance, 2013).

In terms of marketing and communication channels, Apollo English employs various strategies
to reach its target audience. They have a Facebook page with a large number of likes and
followers, indicating a strong online presence. Their YouTube channel has garnered millions of
views. The website is visually appealing, designed with the symbolic colors of Apollo, creating
an atmosphere of purity and passion for learning (Nguyen, 2023).

In conclusion, Apollo Vietnam Education and Training Organization adopts a multi-channel
approach combining direct communication, online media, television sponsorship, and public
relations to effectively market its English courses for children. Moreover, the organization's



commitment to fostering a love for learning, community engagement, and corporate social
responsibility positions it as a leader in shaping the educational landscape in Vietnam.

1.2.2. British Council Case Study

The British Council, a renowned cultural and educational organization, collaborated with Gray
Group to launch an innovative banner advertising campaign titled "Know Your English." The
campaign aimed to engage users in Singapore, Malaysia, Shanghai, and Bangkok by providing
an interactive experience. The banner featured the unique functionality of displaying the
meaning of highlighted words along with an audio clip, enabling users to hear the correct
pronunciation instantly (Brands Vietnam, 2014).

The campaign's standout feature was the ability to interact with users based on their actions.
When users highlighted any word on the website, the banner would dynamically present the
meaning of the word and offer an audio clip for correct pronunciation. Moreover, the campaign
strategically targeted specific regions, including Singapore, Malaysia, Shanghai, and Bangkok.
One of the noteworthy aspects of the campaign is the substantial amount of time users spent
interacting with the banner. This approach likely considered the linguistic diversity and English
language learning interest in these areas.

The success of the "Know Your English" banner campaign offers valuable insights for future
marketing endeavors.The campaign's effectiveness in language learning regions emphasizes the
importance of tailoring advertising strategies to specific demographics and geographical areas.
By seamlessly integrating educational content with user interactivity, the campaign not only
achieved substantial engagement but also surpassed industry benchmarks. The campaign's
success is a testament to the potential of creative and interactive approaches in digital marketing,
particularly in the context of language learning and cultural organizations.

2. MARKET RESEARCH
2.1. The English Training Market in Vietnam

The National Foreign Language Project in Vietnam, spanning from 2008 to 2020, received
criticism for not significantly improving the country's English proficiency. The 2019 EF English
Proficiency Index ranked Vietnam 65th out of 100 countries, indicating a decline since 2015.
Despite government commitments and investments in education, this has led to a robust market
for English language training (Đinh, 2012).



The English Language Training market in Vietnam is thriving for both domestic and foreign
businesses, experiencing strong revenue growth until the onset of the Covid-19 pandemic in
2019. Major players like VUS, Apax English, Apollo English, and British Council recorded
varying profits. The growing affluent class contributes to the demand for high-quality education
following international standards. With public sector education falling short, the demand for
modern educational programs, including English, has surged. Major private brands continue to
thrive, making English training one of the fastest-growing education segments in Vietnam, with a
20% average annual growth rate (Đoàn, 2023).

However, this growth is accompanied by fierce competition and fluctuations in market share.
English proficiency is transitioning from a competitive advantage to a labor market requirement,
driven by globalization and the need for improved communication skills. English, with its high Q
value, remains crucial in this context (Q&Me, 2015).

In summary, despite challenges and increased competition, the English training market in
Vietnam continues to be a lucrative and dynamic sector, propelled by demographic factors,
government investments, and the evolving demands of a globalized workforce.

2.2. Needs for English Language Learning in Vietnam
The surge in globalization has left an indelible mark on countries across the globe, Vietnam
being no exception. The nation's receptive approach, symbolized by its open-door policy and
accession to the WTO, has garnered substantial support and investments from developed nations,
where English functions as the predominant language of communication (Đoàn, 2023). English
proficiency is now a prerequisite for all international trade, import-export activities, and foreign
investments. The realms of politics, economics, and education have experienced noteworthy
investments, notably evidenced by the proliferation of international schools (Đinh, 2012).

Significance of English Across Sectors:



Individual Advantages:

Challenges and Apprehensions:

Trends in Studying Abroad:



In 2015, a survey conducted by Q&Me shed light on the motivations and preferences of English
learners in Vietnam, primarily focusing on individuals aged 18 and above. Notably, half of the
respondents revealed that they pursued English studies with a clear emphasis on career and
job-related objectives, indicating the widespread perception of English as an indispensable asset
for professional growth and employment prospects.

Moreover, data from Coc Coc (2022) revealed English as the dominant language in online
searches, comprising 66% of total language searches. The primary motivation for these searches
was the acquisition of practical knowledge for self-introduction, communication, and
work-related purposes. The survey, which involved 509 respondents, found that 90% considered
learning English crucial and necessary. The participants expressed a strong inclination to learn
English for convenient communication, work-related activities, and personal life. Online
channels, particularly websites and applications, played a significant role in supporting language
learners.

In summation, the imperative to learn English in Vietnam spans economic, educational, and
individual growth dimensions. Proficiency in English is progressively becoming a prerequisite
for success across various sectors, both domestically and globally, as the demand for quality
English education continues its upward trajectory. Addressing the highlighted challenges and
concerns becomes imperative to ensure that graduates are aptly prepared for the competitive and
interconnected global landscape.

2.3. Needs and Interests of Parents in Suburban area
The field survey conducted by Better Life Organization in the suburban areas of the city has
unveiled a pressing demand for English language learning. The residents in these suburbs
express a specific need for affordable English learning opportunities, coupled with a desire to
learn from native speakers, emphasizing the importance of quality education in a dynamic
environment. The identified needs underscore an opportunity for Better Life to tailor its English



learning programs to meet the specific requirements of suburban residents, potentially enhancing
the organization's market presence and impact in these areas.

The expressed interests of parents in suburban areas regarding English learning programs reveal
a multifaceted set of priorities. Affordability emerges as a pivotal factor, underlining the
financial considerations that significantly influence the preferences of parents in suburban areas.
This emphasis on cost-effectiveness reflects the pragmatic approach of this demographic. The
demonstrated interest in technology integration, including online resources and virtual
classrooms, signifies a readiness to embrace modern educational tools. Practical language skills,
such as real-life communication and job interview proficiency, stand out as key areas of interest,
reflecting a practical orientation in English education

Understanding the nuanced needs and interests of parents in suburban areas is paramount for
Better Life Organization's mission to design effective and appealing English learning programs.
By aligning with these findings, the organization can enhance its outreach and ensure that its
educational initiatives resonate with the target audience in these specific communities,
contributing to the enrichment of English education in suburban areas.

2.4. Mobile Trends in English Learning in Vietnam
In recent years, the surge in interest in mobile-assisted language learning has sparked curiosity
about how second language (L2) learners, specifically in Vietnam, utilize and perceive
smartphone apps for learning English (Nguyễn, 2022). This section delves into the purposes and
attitudes of L2 learners concerning Smartphone English Language Learning Apps (SELLA) in
the Vietnamese context.

The proliferation of mobile technology, especially smartphones, has prompted a paradigm shift
in education. Language learning, benefitting from this trend, has seen substantial advancements
through Computer-Assisted Language Learning (CALL), Mobile-Assisted Language Learning
(MALL), and Technology-Assisted Language Learning (TALL) (Bui et al., 2023). Smartphones
offer advantages such as cost-effectiveness, efficiency, interactivity, and convenience in language
learning. The abundance of mobile applications, especially SELLA, designed to aid English
language acquisition, has garnered increased interest among L2 English learners in Vietnam (Bui
et al., 2023).

Notably, in the aftermath of the COVID-19 pandemic, online English learning became a
preferred option, fostering a robust market for English teaching apps. Duolingo, a prominent
player in this space, experienced a remarkable 67% growth in active users in Vietnam from
January 2021 to January 2022. Vietnam emerged as the largest market in Southeast Asia and the
second-largest in Asia, following India, for Duolingo (Nguyễn, 2022).



Duolingo's revenue streams include in-app advertising, Duolingo Plus membership subscriptions,
and fees for the Duolingo English Test. The app's revenue hit $250 million in the previous year,
showcasing the success of its free strategy, which garnered a substantial user base before
introducing a membership registration mechanism (Nguyễn, 2022).

In conclusion, the study provides valuable insights into the dynamic landscape of English
language learning in Vietnam, emphasizing the pivotal role of SELLA and the accelerating
growth of online language learning platforms.

2.5. Communication Touchpoints in English Learning
In the realm of English language learning, online advertising emerges as the predominant
communication touchpoint, capturing the attention of a substantial majority of working
individuals. It claims the top spot, standing out significantly from word-of-mouth
recommendations and traditional media, which hold the second and third positions, respectively.
Notably, the remaining direct touchpoints exhibit a lower reach, engaging only about 1/8 to 1/7
of respondents expressing a desire to learn English (Coc Coc, 2022).

Breaking down the realm of online advertising further, search engines take the lead as the
preferred means for individuals with a keen interest in learning English for personal
development. Notably, prominent search engines such as Google and Coc Coc capture a
significant share of user preference, constituting 53.0% of online advertising usage (Coc Coc,
2022).

Following closely, social networks also play a pivotal role in the online advertising landscape for
English learning. Platforms like Facebook, Twitter, Instagram, and Zalo collectively capture the
attention of a considerable portion of the target audience, representing 45.2% of social networks
usage in the context of English learning (Coc Coc, 2022).

These findings underscore the digital dominance in reaching and engaging individuals interested
in learning English. In light of this digital landscape, organizations and educational institutions
seeking to attract English learners are advised to strategically leverage online advertising. A
particular emphasis should be placed on enhancing search engine visibility and maintaining a
robust presence on social media platforms. This strategic focus aligns with the evolving
preferences and behaviors of the target audience, ensuring maximum impact and effectiveness in
the competitive arena of English language learning outreach (Coc Coc, 2022).



3. THEORETICAL FRAMEWORK
3.1. E-Content Development Theories

3.1.1. AIDA Model

The utilization of the AIDA Model theory in the project aims to strategically guide the
Communication Campaign for Better Life Organization, focusing on BeLi English and Bstudy,
by understanding and addressing the stages individuals go through in the process of making
decisions related to brand engagement and participation.

The AIDA Model, developed in 1898 by St Elmo Lewis, delineates a linear hierarchy of stages
that a potential customer typically progresses through during the decision-making process:
Attention, Interest, Desire, and Action. This model has found enduring relevance in advertising,
digital marketing, sales strategies, and public relations campaigns due to its simplicity and
effectiveness in capturing the essence of the customer's journey (CFI, n.d.; Oxford University
Press, n.d.).

AIDA Model

The Communication Campaign progresses through stages: Attention (creating awareness),
Interest (stimulating curiosity), Desire (connecting benefits with consumer needs), and finally,
Action (prompting purchase). Crafting standout content is key in the Attention stage. Moving to
Interest involves highlighting product features and benefits. The Desire stage requires
persuasion, connecting product benefits with consumer desires. The ultimate goal is to drive
consumers to the Action stage, where they actively seek and purchase the product. Effective
advertising transcends awareness and interest, culminating in tangible actions.



The AIDA Model aligns with the project's goals by providing a structured framework to guide
communication strategies. The campaign aims to influence the target audience behavior, moving
them from initial awareness to active engagement and, ultimately, participation with BeLi
English and Bstudy. This model serves as a roadmap for designing compelling content and
interactions that resonate with the audience at each stage of their decision-making journey.

3.1.2. Maslow’s Motivation Model

The choice to incorporate Maslow's Motivation Model theory in the content development for the
Communication Campaign for Better Life Organization stems from the understanding that
motivation plays a pivotal role in the success of any endeavor, especially in the context of
language learning and educational programs. Maslow's Need Theory of Motivation provides a
comprehensive framework for understanding the diverse needs that individuals bring to the
workplace and educational settings (Jones, 2023). This theory suggests that motivation is
intrinsically tied to fulfilling a hierarchy of needs, ranging from basic physiological requirements
to higher-order needs like self-actualization.

Maslow’s Motivation Model

In the Attention stage, the primary objective is to capture the consumer's notice and initiate
awareness of the product or service. For the Communication Campaign, this implies crafting
content and messaging that stands out, ensuring that the audience becomes aware of the
existence and offerings of BeLi English and Bstudy (Oxford University Press, n.d.).



Moving to the Interest stage, the campaign aims to stimulate curiosity and engagement. This
involves communicating the special features and benefits of the products, addressing specific
needs, and fostering a favorable response from the audience. Content design becomes crucial
during this stage to maintain interest and prompt the consumer to explore further (Oxford
University Press, n.d.).

The Desire stage represents a more intricate phase where the campaign seeks to create a
connection between the product's benefits and the consumer's needs and wants. This requires a
persuasive approach to convince the audience that the product is not only attractive but also
aligned with their desires and requirements. The challenge lies in moving beyond mere interest
to genuine desire (Oxford University Press, n.d.).

Ultimately, the campaign endeavors to lead the audience to the Action stage, where consumers
actively seek out the product and make a purchase. This is the culmination of successful brand
communication efforts, emphasizing that effective advertising goes beyond creating awareness
and interest; it should drive tangible actions (Oxford University Press, n.d.).

3.2. Communication Campaign Planning Theories
3.2.1. Communication Campaign Theory

Communication Campaign Theory

The utilization of communication campaign theory, particularly drawing from Atkin and Rice's
definition (2012), serves as a foundational framework for the project with the goal of enhancing
the brand awareness of BeLi English and Bstudy. Rice and Atkin conceptualize a communication
campaign as purposeful, emphasizing its objective to inform or influence behaviors within a
defined mass audience and timeframe.



The key rationale for employing communication campaign theory lies in its structured and
strategic approach. This organization is crucial for ensuring that the campaign's messages are
cohesive, consistent, and effectively transmitted across various mediated channels. The use of
multiple channels is particularly significant as it allows the campaign to reach a broad and
diverse audience, maximizing its impact (Atkin & Rice, 2012).The theory acknowledges the
importance of a specific timeframe, emphasizing the need for a concentrated and time-sensitive
effort.

Furthermore, the theoretical foundation provides a systematic guide for planning, implementing,
and evaluating the campaign. It underscores the purposeful nature of communication campaigns,
emphasizing the intentionality behind each message and activity (Atkin & Rice, 2012).

In summary, the adoption of communication campaign theory, provides the project with a
structured and purposeful framework. This framework guides the planning and execution of
organized communication activities, ensuring a strategic approach to inform and influence mass
audiences effectively within a specified timeframe.

3.2.2. SWOT Analysis

The choice to utilize the SWOT analysis theory in the content development for the
Communication Campaign for Better Life Organization is rooted in the strategic planning
process it offers. SWOT, which stands for Strengths, Weaknesses, Opportunities, and Threats,
provides a comprehensive framework for assessing both internal and external factors that can
impact the success of the campaign (Schooley, 2023).



SWOT Analysis Model

In the context of the Communication Campaign, a SWOT analysis allows for a systematic
evaluation of internal factors (Strengths and Weaknesses) and external factors (Opportunities and
Threats). Strengths may include aspects like financial resources, physical resources, human
resources, and intellectual property. Weaknesses, on the other hand, may encompass areas
needing improvement, such as processes, skills, or resource limitations.

The SWOT analysis involves creating a table that juxtaposes the four elements, facilitating a
clear comparison. The interplay between internal strengths and weaknesses with external
opportunities and threats provides valuable insights. For instance, recognizing how internal
weaknesses may align with external threats can pinpoint critical issues requiring attention.
Furthermore, the SWOT analysis serves as a foundation for generating recommendations and
strategies based on the identified factors. By leveraging strengths and opportunities to overcome
weaknesses and threats, the Communication Campaign can develop creative and innovative
approaches.

In essence, the SWOT analysis theory is chosen for its ability to provide a structured and
comprehensive understanding of the internal and external landscape, empowering the Better Life
Organization to make informed decisions and develop effective strategies for the Communication
Campaign.

3.2.3. Consumer Decision Making Process

The adoption of the Consumer Decision Making Process theory for the Communication
Campaign for Better Life Organization is rooted in the recognition of the pivotal role consumer



behavior plays in the success of marketing strategies. The paper of Stankevich's literature review
and evaluation of core models and theories in the area of buying decision-making (2017)
underscore the significance of understanding how and why consumers make purchasing
decisions.

The 5 stages of the consumer decision-making process

The consumer decision-making process represents a dynamic journey, and recognizing the
"moments that matter" in this process becomes a strategic imperative. The framework presented
in the research highlights the key factors that influence consumer behavior, providing marketers
with insights into opportunities to sway decisions in favor of the company's offerings. The focus
on understanding these decisive moments and influencing factors positions marketers to tailor
their campaigns effectively (Stankevich, 2017).

Moreover, the research acknowledges that consumer behavior is often influenced by irrational
choices, challenging traditional economic theories and assumptions about rationality. The
emergence of behavioral economics as a field underscores the importance of understanding the
context of decisions in the marketplace (Stankevich, 2017).



The Consumer Decision Making Process theory encompasses various decision-making phases,
from extended problem-solving to limited problem-solving and habitual decision-making.
Recognizing the diversity of consumer decision journeys allows marketers to tailor their
strategies accordingly, employing different approaches based on the complexity of the decision
(Stankevich, 2017).

In conclusion, the adoption of the Consumer Decision Making Process theory in the
Communication Campaign for Better Life Organization is a strategic choice driven by the need
to deeply understand and influence consumer behavior. By aligning marketing strategies with the
intricacies of the decision-making process, the campaign aims to create value, enhance customer
satisfaction, and gain a competitive edge in the market.

3.3. Brand Development Theories
3.3.1. Branding and Brand Image Theory

The incorporation of branding and brand image theory is integral to the project's strategy for
enhancing the brand awareness of BeLi English and Bstudy. The American Marketing
Association defines a brand as any distinctive feature that identifies goods or services,
encompassing elements such as name, logo, color scheme, typography, and design. Brand
identity, as a subset, involves these visual and symbolic elements working in concert to establish
a recognizable image for the brand, facilitating consumer identification and connection
(American Marketing Association, n.d.).

Theoretical framework for Brand Identity and Brand Image



According to Bambang Sukma Wijaya (2013), brand image holds paramount importance in
brand development. It is intricately linked to a brand's reputation and credibility, serving as a
guiding factor for consumers in deciding to engage with a product or service. The brand image
shapes a unique experience for consumers, influencing their inclination to become loyalists or
opportunists who may easily switch to another brand. In essence, brand image becomes a
decisive factor in consumer behavior, impacting brand loyalty and market positioning.

Brand marketing, as described by the American Marketing Association, is the strategic approach
employed by companies to promote and establish a brand in the market (American Marketing
Association, n.d.). This involves creating a distinct identity, values, and perceptions that
differentiate the brand from its competitors. The key components in this process are brand
elements, including the name, logo, symbol, package design, or other characteristics that set a
product apart and make it identifiable. (Keller, 2012 & American Marketing Association)

In summary, the project's adoption of branding and brand image theory is grounded in the
understanding that a well-crafted brand identity and image are pivotal in influencing consumer
behavior, fostering loyalty, and differentiating BeLi English and Bstudy in the competitive
market. By leveraging these theoretical frameworks, the project aims to strategically position and
promote the brands, creating a lasting and positive impact on their target audiences.

3.3.2. Brand Archetype

The adoption of Brand Archetype theory in the brand development for the Communication
Campaign for Better Life Organization is driven by the understanding that brand archetypes are
integral to shaping brand personality. This approach allows marketing managers to define the
essence of a brand, its values, and the connection it establishes with consumers. By employing
archetypal frameworks, brands can transcend the mere transactional relationship with consumers
and imbue their offerings with deeper, symbolic meanings aligned with customers' desires and
motivations.



The 12 Brand Archetype

In the archetypal approach, the emphasis shifts from the tangible products to the intangible
aspects of brand experience and meaning. It acknowledges that consumers' perceptions are not
solely shaped by marketing narratives but are also influenced by personal experiences, word of
mouth, and exposure to media and pop culture. This recognition of external influences underlines
the importance of tailoring brand strategies to accommodate diverse consumer perceptions across
cultures. The use of archetypes in brand development creates a spiritual and mystical identity for
brands, fostering a more profound and meaningful connection with consumers on a subconscious
level. (Adi et al., 2015; Siraj & Kumari, 2011; Xara-Brasil et al., 2018)

Mark and Pearson's archetypal model, rooted in Carl Jung's theory, categorizes 12 archetypes
into four main human drivers: "belonging and enjoyment," "independence and fulfillment,"
"stability and control," and "risk and mystery." The two-axis framework proposed by Mark and
Pearson helps group archetypes into clusters based on common attributes and major human
drivers, providing a nuanced understanding of the motivations that guide consumer behavior.
(Mark & Pearson, 2001; Xara-Brasil et al., 2018)



Brand personality model

The Brand Archetype theory offers a comprehensive framework that aligns with the varied
motivations of consumers (Xara-Brasil et al., 2018). By understanding and leveraging these
archetypal dimensions, the Communication Campaign for Better Life Organization seeks to
create a brand narrative that resonates deeply with the diverse aspirations and fears of its target
audience, fostering a more meaningful and lasting brand-consumer relationship.

3.3.3. Top-Of-Mind Awareness

The adoption of Top-of-Mind Awareness (TOMA) theory in the brand development for the
Communication Campaign for Better Life Organization is rooted in the fundamental
understanding that brand awareness is a foundational element of customer-based brand equity.
Aaker's (1991) customer-based brand-equity dimensions underscore the significance of
awareness, asserting that a brand holds no value or equity if customers are not aware of it. Brand
awareness, as highlighted by Kapferer (2005), serves as an indicator of brand equity, signifying
saliency and the extent to which a customer's mind is engaged when cued by the product.

Aaker (1991) further delineates two levels of awareness: stimulus-based brand recognition and
memory-based brand recall, commonly known as top-of-mind awareness (TOMA). TOMA
gauges whether a brand is recalled without the use of any memory aid, representing a more
challenging but potent form of brand awareness. TOMA is not merely an indicator of the
intention to purchase but a critical factor in influencing actual brand choice and behavioral
tendencies (Hakala et al., 2012).



Top-Of-Mind Awareness model

Following Keller's (1993) definition of brand equity, which posits that favorable brand
associations lead to positive responses such as purchase intention or choice, TOMA becomes a
strategic element in shaping consumer behavior. The linkage between the need and the brand
name is emphasized by various authors, underlining its critical role in brand success (Hakala et
al., 2012).

In summary, TOMA is not merely a measure of brand recall but a strategic lever that, when
effectively leveraged, can lead to stronger brand preference and loyalty. By making a brand
top-of-mind in the relevant category, Better Life Organization aims to position BeLi English and
Bstudy as preferred choices, influencing consumer behavior and fostering a deeper connection
between the brand and its audience. The incorporation of TOMA theory in the Communication
Campaign aligns with the goal of enhancing brand awareness and, consequently, customer-based
brand equity.

3.3.4. Lovemarks Theory

The adoption of Lovemarks theory in the brand development for the Communication Campaign
for Better Life Organization stems from a recognition of the evolving nature of consumer-brand
relationships. Lovemarks theory, introduced by Roberts (2004), posits that brand loyalty
transcends rationality and is driven by two essential components: "love" and "respect.”. Respect
reflects the functional aspects of a brand, encompassing performance, reputation, and trust, while
love delves into the emotional attributes that foster a deep, passionate connection between
consumers and the brand.



Brand Lovemarks model

In a contemporary marketing landscape where functional benefits alone may not suffice for
differentiation due to the similarity in product attributes, emotional benefits play a pivotal role in
crafting brand-based differentiation strategies (Fournier, 1998; Roberts, 2004; Carroll and
Ahuvia, 2006; Batra et al., 2012; Giovanis & Athanasopoulou, 2018). Lovemarks theory
acknowledges the significance of emotional connections in consumer-brand relationships and
classifies brands into four types based on the love-respect grid: Lovemark brands, quality brands,
fads, and mere products.

Lovemark brands, as vividly described by Pawle and Cooper (2006), go beyond expectations of
great performance. They establish intimate, emotional connections with consumers, reaching not
only the mind but also the heart and gut. Lovemarks are characterized by a profound sense of
passion and are embraced with fervor, creating enduring relationships that go beyond mere
transactions. The Lovemarks theory aligns with the goal of the Communication Campaign,
aiming to position BeLi English and Bstudy as highly desired brands that not only fulfill
functional needs but also elicit deep emotional connections. The theory recognizes that
Lovemarks are not easily replaceable, and their absence is mourned by consumers, emphasizing
the enduring nature of the relationships they foster (Giovanis & Athanasopoulou, 2018).

By integrating Lovemarks theory into the brand development strategy, Better Life Organization
seeks to go beyond conventional brand loyalty, fostering emotional connections that resonate
with consumers and contribute to sustained brand success. The campaign aims to position BeLi



English and Bstudy not just as educational services but as Lovemarks that inspire passion and
commitment among their audience.

3.4. Risk Management Theories
The application of Risk Management theory in the project to optimize the effectiveness of the
Communication Campaign for Better Life Organization, specifically for BeLi English and
Bstudy, is grounded in the evolving landscape of project management and the inherent
complexities and uncertainties associated with projects.

Risk Management model

Modern project management, as highlighted by Edwards and Bowen (2013), extends beyond
traditional tasks of organizing, controlling, and acquiring resources (Edwards & Bowen, 2013). It
now grapples with the dynamic demands of numerous stakeholders and necessitates dealing with
competing and conflicting priorities. With the sophistication of tools and techniques, project
managers can generate better information and exert greater control over projects, facilitated by
advancements in information and communication technology.

Risk, as a concept, is deeply embedded in the societal context, shaped by societal norms, values,
and practices. Edwards and Bowen (2013) emphasize the contextual nature of risks, arising from
decisions to engage in activities, carry out tasks, make commitments, or enter obligations
(Edwards & Bowen, 2013). This sociological framing of risk underscores the importance of
understanding and managing risks within the specific context of the project and its environment.



The principles of risk management, as outlined by Mobey & Parker (2002), Kishk & Ukaga
(2008), and Lam et al. (2007), offer a systematic and quantitative approach to assess, anticipate,
and address potential risks throughout the project lifecycle. Risk management is crucial for
assessing project viability, controlling risks to minimize loss, alleviating risks through proper
planning, and avoiding dissatisfactory projects to enhance profit margins.

Risk management principles also enhance team involvement by providing a mechanism for
reporting potential problems, increasing the team's stake in the overall project success.
Embedding risk into the decision-making process becomes a long-term exercise, ensuring that
risk considerations are central to decision-making, aligning with the overarching goals of the
Communication Campaign for Better Life Organization.

4. COMPANY ANALYSIS
4.1. BeLi English

Founded in 2016, BeLi English Center has solidified its position as a long-standing institution in
the language education sector (BeLi English, 2023). While not widely recognized, the main
center's deliberate choice of location on the outskirts, rather than in more central and strategic
areas, has been a deliberate strategy to cater to the needs of residents in suburban areas of the
city. The center casts a wide net, catering to a diverse clientele ranging from 3 to 40 years old.
BeLi's offerings extend beyond traditional English language programs, encompassing an array of
subjects such as Science, Technology, Arts, Mathematics, and Soft & Life Skills. BeLi English’s
commitment to excellence in language education is embodied in their six state-of-the-art
facilities situated across Vietnam—three in Hanoi, one in Bac Ninh, and one in Ho Chi Minh
City—with over 3000 students actively engaged in a transformative learning experience. They
take pride in their mission to cultivate language proficiency and global awareness, and our
impressive track record reflects this dedication. (See Appendix 4)

BeLi English Achievements
Key Achievements:



Cambridge Certificates: A remarkable 291 students have achieved Cambridge certificates, a
testament to the efficacy of BeLi teaching methods and the commitment of learners (BeLi
English, 2023).
IELTS: Many students pass IELTS, 99% of students meet the output standards without needing
to retake (BeLi English, 2023).

4.1.1. Insights

BeLi English's insights play a pivotal role in the execution of the communication campaign for
the Better Life Organization, particularly in enhancing brand awareness. Understanding BeLi
English insights is crucial for the Viva team to implement BeLi English's communication
campaign, enabling tailored engagement with the Better Life Organization community. This
approach ensures a deep resonance with the audience's needs, preferences, and aspirations,
fostering higher engagement and connection.

BeLi English's insight-driven communication campaign for the Better Life Organization is
strategically attuned to the dynamic landscape of the English training market in Vietnam (Đoàn,
2023). This campaign recognizes the urgent and growing need for English proficiency in the
country, with a particular focus on catering to the market demand for learning English in
suburban areas (BeLi English Marketing Department, 2023). The price strategy i.e. “reasonable
price" aligns with the practical considerations of the target audience. It conveys the message that
BeLi English is dedicated to providing high-quality education without sacrificing accessibility.
BeLi English primarily offers offline courses to provide students with diverse and rich in-person
activities. Offline courses have their unique advantages, including face-to-face interactions,
group activities, and real-time feedback (BeLi English, 2023). By carefully integrating online
learning components, BeLi English can enhance its overall educational offerings, making
learning more accessible and flexible for a broader range of students while maintaining the
valuable in-person experiences that are a hallmark of offline courses (BeLi English, 2023). By
understanding that online advertising, particularly through search engines and social networks,
dominates communication touchpoints, BeLi English strategically engages with its target
audience through these channels.



Diverse Learning Activities at BeLi English

The insights gained from the English training market's competitive landscape, the educational
needs of the Vietnamese population, the prevalence of mobile learning, and the effectiveness of
online advertising contribute to BeLi English's campaign efficacy (An Binh, 2023; Bui et al.,
2023; Đinh, 2012); Đoàn, 2023; Hà & Phạm, 2015). The campaign not only meets the immediate
need for English proficiency but also aligns with the broader goals of the Better Life
Organization. By addressing specific challenges faced by learners, offering adaptable and
flexible learning solutions, and optimizing resource allocation based on audience preferences,
BeLi English enhances its brand awareness and influence within the Better Life Organization
community. The campaign's impact goes beyond conventional metrics, fostering long-term
relationships and contributing to positive social impact, thereby solidifying BeLi English's
position as a socially responsible education provider in Vietnam.

4.1.2. Brief of Our Clients

The client is a visionary leader who is dedicated to improving educational possibilities and
empowering people via language learning: the CEO of Better Life Organisation. The CEO hopes
to answer the changing demands of learners—especially with regard to English language
competency in Vietnam—by utilizing creative solutions with an emphasis on making a good
social impact. The primary objective of the communication campaign is to elevate the brand
awareness of BeLi English, positioning it as a high-quality, practical learning platform. The
focus is not only on acquiring international certificates but also on providing a fun and
comfortable learning experience, all while maintaining an affordable tuition structure.
Additionally, the goal is to communicate the availability of online classes and leverage Bstudy as
a tool for efficient student management. The communication campaign aims to transform BeLi
English into a recognized and preferred brand for quality, practical learning. By combining
online segment strategies, integration with Bstudy, and emphasizing customer-friendly and
professional qualities, the objective is to significantly increase student registrations and brand
engagement.



Client Brief for BeLi English

4.1.3. Context of BeLi English

In the contemporary context of globalization and the surging demand for English proficiency,
language centers have evolved beyond traditional roles (An Binh, 2023). In a world
characterized by intense competition and rapid developments, English centers, including BeLi
English, play a pivotal role in offering diverse learning experiences. Students today seek not just



language skills but also exposure to science, technology, arts, mathematics, and essential soft
skills (An Binh, 2023).

The advent of technology has catalyzed the rise of online learning, allowing students to engage
with coursework at their own pace and convenience (Bui et al., 2023). This dual challenge and
opportunity have compelled English centers to innovate, adapting their teaching methods.

Established in 2016, BeLi English Center has grown to encompass five facilities across
Vietnam—three in Hanoi, one in Bac Ninh, and one in Ho Chi Minh City—with over 3000
students (BeLi English, 2023). Targeting a wide age range, from 3 to 40 years old, BeLi English
offers a diverse array of programs spanning not only English learning but also science,
technology, arts, mathematics, and soft skills.

The integration of modern learning methods, including technology and hands-on activities,
ensures that the learning process is both captivating and applicable to real-life scenarios. The
center's success is evident in the notable achievements of its students, with a substantial number
attaining Cambridge certificates and a high percentage meeting the standards for IELTS without
the need for retakes.

Unique Learning Method of BeLi English

In its pursuit of becoming a leading English Center, BeLi English emphasizes reputable quality,
reasonable pricing, clear educational outcomes, and a diverse and enjoyable learning
environment. The center's commitment to innovation and excellence underscores its role in
shaping the future of English education in Vietnam.

4.1.4. Customer Analysis





4.1.5. Competitor Analysis

Choosing a competitor for BeLi English English center is done based on two strategic reasons.
That's because both BeLi English and its competitors target the low-cost segment, serve the same
customers, and both have facilities in the same area. This choice helps BeLi English capture
specific markets, optimize marketing and promotion strategies, as well as enhance competition in
the local environment.

4.1.5.1. International English System Scots English Long Bien





International English System Scots English Long Bien

4.1.5.2. Bright Smile Academy Foreign Language Center



Bright Smile Academy

4.1.5.3. ETC Foreign Language and Skills Center





ETC Foreign Language and Skills Center

4.1.5.4. TalkFirst English



TalkFirst English

4.1.5.5. Res Vietnam English Center





Res Vietnam English Center

4.1.6. Brand Positioning





4.1.7. Communication Strategy Analysis

BeLi English caters to a diverse audience, including children under 13 and students/workers aged
13 to 40, offering English learning programs and interdisciplinary courses (BeLi English,
2023)(154). BeLi English center has quite good communication strategies for its fanpage. They
already have the ideas of content that appeal to customers such as: sharing fun videos in the
classroom, sharing student achievements, sharing enrollment information and discount strategies.
However, the current communication strategy has some drawbacks. The fanpage interactions are
suboptimal, facing competition from other pages with established quality and reputation. The
content lacks focus, consistency, and professionalism, hindering effective communication.
Currently, BeLi English Center relies on "Word of Mouth" without a defined strategy, resulting
in weak social network channel development.







4.2. Bstudy
Bstudy emerges as a transformative force in the realm of English language education, offering an
exceptionally effective learning and teaching application for both students and teachers.
Personalized, interactive, and highly effective learning is what makes Bstudy stand out as a
cutting-edge platform that goes beyond limitations. Its strategic features align with contemporary
educational needs, making it a valuable asset for students and teachers alike. (This is an internal
document of the enterprise, not made public) As the platform continues to evolve, Bstudy stands
poised to further revolutionize English language education. (See Appendix 5)

4.2.1. Insights

Positioned within a competitive landscape, Bstudy understands the evolving needs of English
learners in the country, particularly the demand for practical language skills in both academic
and professional contexts (Suputra, n.d.). Acknowledging the significant role of online platforms
and mobile technology in English language learning, Bstudy aligns its campaign with the
prevalent mobile trends, recognizing the effectiveness of smartphone apps and the increasing
popularity of online English learning resources (Bstudy, 2023).

In response to the compelling need for English proficiency in Vietnam, Bstudy tailors its
communication strategy to emphasize the practical benefits of language learning, catering to both
students and working professionals.

Furthermore, Bstudy's campaign reflects an awareness of the economic and social factors
influencing the English training market, including the impact of COVID-19 on the shift to online
learning (BMC Medical Education, 2021). By leveraging this insight, Bstudy positions itself as
an adaptable and innovative solution provider, meeting the changing needs of learners amid
pandemic-induced disruptions.



4.2.2. Brief of Our Clients

The client is the CEO of Better Life Organization, a visionary leader committed to enhancing
educational opportunities and empowering individuals through language learning. With a focus
on creating positive social impact, the CEO envisions leveraging innovative solutions to address
the evolving needs of learners, particularly in the context of English language proficiency in
Vietnam. The CEO aims to implement a robust communication campaign for Bstudy, aligning
with the Better Life Organization's mission to provide accessible and impactful education. The
primary goal is to enhance brand awareness and promote Bstudy 2.0, a transformative
educational platform set to launch in December 2023. The client seeks a campaign that not only
highlights Bstudy's advanced features but also emphasizes its role in reshaping the online
learning landscape.

Client Brief for Bstudy





4.2.3. Context of Bstudy

Bstudy, an integral part of the Better Life Education and Training Corporation, operates within a
reputable educational organization with extensive experience in training and education. Bstudy
represents the intersection of education and technology, offering modern, creative learning, and
teaching solutions for both educators and learners (Bstudy, 2023).

The application is designed to provide interactive, flexible, and personalized learning
experiences, enriched with diverse educational content and advanced interactive tools. Notably,
Bstudy extends its impact beyond student learning to create smart classroom management tools,
facilitating effective and convenient organization, management, and evaluation of the teaching
process for educators (Bstudy, 2023).

The passion for creating advanced and innovative learning experiences is evident in Bstudy's
achievements within its first six months of operation. (Excerpted from internal company
documents, not made public) With 1600 students actively using the application and a cumulative
vocabulary exceeding 68,000, Bstudy has demonstrated its effectiveness in delivering diverse
and rich educational content. The recurring usage rate of 60% attests to the platform's stability
and user engagement. Over 100 teachers have leveraged the application to enhance the teaching
process, and more than 30 schools and centers have adopted Bstudy, showcasing its influence
across various educational institutions. A remarkable 30% paid account ratio and a Monthly
Transaction Value (GMV) exceeding 28 million underscore Bstudy's market adoption and
potential for further growth. These accomplishments affirm Bstudy's mission of providing
innovative and effective educational solutions, emphasizing its commitment to advancing the
realms of education and technology for the betterment of both educators and students.

4.2.4. Customer Analysis

Bstudy, an Exceptionally Effective English Learning and Teaching Application, strategically
targets students, English teachers, and educational institutions, offering a versatile and advanced
English learning and teaching application. The application's adaptability, user-centric features,
and focus on technological integration position it as an effective tool for diverse educational
needs.







4.2.5. Competitors Analysis

In the vibrant landscape of English learning applications, Bstudy emerges as a contender with a
distinctive approach that places it at the forefront of innovation. Bstudy's competitive advantage
lies in its innovative approach, leveraging technology for a comprehensive learning experience.
While competitors excel in specific areas such as user base, pronunciation, or memory-focused
learning, Bstudy aims to carve its niche by offering a holistic platform that combines advanced
technology with effective teaching methods. Continued innovation and a focus on personalized
learning will be key for Bstudy's success in this dynamic market. Bstudy sets itself apart through
an innovative and interactive learning experience, incorporating cutting-edge technologies such
as artificial intelligence (AI) and data analytics. The emphasis on personalized learning solutions
distinguishes Bstudy from its competitors, providing users with a tailored educational journey.



4.2.6. Brand Positioning





4.2.7. Communication Strategy Analysis

CHAPTER 3. PROJECT PLANNING

1. OVERVIEW OF MASTER PLAN
1.1. Our Goals And Objectives

1.1.1. Our Long-term Goals

The Communication Campaign for Better Life Organization has a long-term goal of boosting the
brand awareness of Better Life. This initiative focuses on two subsidiary companies, BeLi
English and Bstudy, which align with the organization's overall vision. The project aims to
support the creation of an interconnected education system, fostering a holistic learning
experience for young individuals, particularly in English language acquisition. Going beyond
language proficiency, the organization seeks to promote essential soft skills crucial for personal
and professional development. The ultimate objective is to establish a strong brand presence for



BeLi English and Bstudy, positioning them as integral components within the educational
ecosystem. This strategic move contributes to the broader mission of Better Life Organization,
which is dedicated to empowering individuals through comprehensive and interconnected
learning opportunities.

1.1.2. Beli English Communication Objectives

Communication objectives for BeLi English would typically focus on creating awareness,
building a positive brand image, and encouraging engagement among the target audience. By
aligning communication objectives with these project goals, BeLi English can effectively
position itself as a leading English center with a focus on quality education at an affordable cost,
fostering increased awareness, engagement, and positive brand perception among the target
audience.



1.1.3. Bstudy Communication Objectives

Bstudy is an English learning application that makes it easier for learners to learn vocabulary.
The application can also connect with teachers to make the learning process easier. By focusing
on these communication objectives, Bstudy can establish itself as a user-friendly English
learning application with a strong social media presence, fostering increased awareness,
engagement, and adoption among both students and teachers.

1.2. Our Project Big Idea and Key Messages

The big idea for the communication campaign "Creating A Clear Brand Identity and Ensuring Its
Consistency via E-Content Strategies' '. This overarching theme establishes a consistent and
cohesive brand identity for BeLi English and Bstudy, subsidiaries of the Better Life
Organization. Includes three main activities: Media product development, communication
activity alignment, media quality reinforcement.



Key Messages
Our project key messages collectively project Better Life as an innovative, quality-focused, and
comprehensive educational brand. They appeal to the target audience's desire for a modern,
engaging learning environment and emphasize the broader educational benefits beyond language
proficiency.



1.3. Project Key Concept
The primary focus of Project Key Concept is to imbue professionalism in providing scholarly,
reliable information in a familiar, easy-to-understand, and friendly style. This strategic approach
aims to facilitate better engagement with the target audience, fostering a positive and lasting
impression of the Better Life Organization brand.



1.4. Project Timeline



2. BELI ENGLISH COMMUNICATION PLAN (See Appendix
2)
2.1. Big Idea and Key Message

2.1.1. Big Idea
“Creating A Clear Brand Identity and Ensuring Its Consistency via E-Content Strategies”
This overarching theme establishes a consistent and cohesive brand identity for BeLi English and
Bstudy, subsidiaries of the Better Life Organization.

- Media Product Development: Create synchronized and cohesive media products to
convey standardized brand messages.

- Communication Activity Alignment: Implement consistent strategies across various
communication channels to reinforce a unified brand identity.

- Media Quality Reinforcement: Strengthen the quality of communication processes to
ensure a standardized and impactful brand representation.

2.1.2. Key Message
"Learn the most, no worries about cost" (Học vui hết ý, không lo chi phí)



The key message of BeLi English, encapsulated in the phrase "Learning has fun, no worries
about costs," conveys the essence of a positive and affordable learning experience. This message
emphasizes that the process of learning English at BeLi is enjoyable, engaging, and devoid of
financial concerns. It highlights the commitment to providing a fun and interactive educational
environment without imposing burdensome costs, aiming to make language learning accessible
and stress-free for students. The phrase reflects BeLi English's dedication to combining the
elements of enjoyment and affordability in its approach to language education.



2.2. Key Concept











2.3. Key Activities





2.4. Communication Timeline



2.4.1. Time to post

2.5. KPI and Measurement Methods





3. BSTUDY COMMUNICATION PLAN (See Appendix 3)

3.1. Big Idea and Key Message
3.1.1. Big Idea

"Teach Together, Learn Together, Together with Bstudy" (Cùng Dạy, Cùng Học, Cùng Bstudy)
In the contemporary world, the process of learning and teaching has evolved beyond individual
actions; it has become a community journey where people connect, share knowledge, and
support each other in their personal and professional development. "Teach Together, Learn
Together, Bstudy Together" is the foundational idea of Bstudy, creating a dynamic and positive
learning community where both teachers and students immerse themselves.

From "Teach Together, Learn Together,Together With Bstudy," the emphasis is on solidarity,
support, and the power of learning as a community. Bstudy is committed to providing a learning
experience that is not only of quality but also meaningful and engaging.

3.1.2. Key Message
“Better Education - Better Life"

The phrase "Better Education - Better Life" underscores the crucial role of education in an
individual's life. Education not only imparts the knowledge and skills necessary for personal
development but also opens up opportunities for career advancement. A quality education system
creates knowledgeable and conscientious citizens capable of making positive contributions to
society. Bstudy is dedicated to delivering a meaningful and engaging education that contributes
to the betterment of individual lives and society as a whole.



3.2. Key Concept







3.3. Key Activities





3.4. Communication Timeline

3.5. KPI and Measurement Methods



4. PROJECT RISK MANAGEMENT











5. ESTIMATED COST
Below is a detailed estimated cost table for implementing the campaign. This table is built based
on information collected from clients as well as the group's network relationships from partners
and media agencies. Costs are specifically classified to fully reflect all aspects of the campaign,
from advertising and media costs to other costs such as events and market research.

Notably, this table is only an estimated cost and will undergo adjustments when the Viva team
participates in the campaign. The contribution of the Viva team will adjust the strategy to ensure
efficiency and cost in project implementation.





CHAPTER 4. PROJECT EXECUTION

1. BELI ENGLISH PLAN IMPLEMENTATION
To achieve client requirements and at the same time meet Viva Team's goals, our team built a
comprehensive content strategy plan for BeLi, with a key focus on stabilizing owned media
channels to create uniformity and enhance brand recognition.

Viva Team has proposed a series of measures to implement this strategy. First, we will redesign
the logo and brand colors to ensure uniformity in communicating the message and keep the
brand consistent. Second, our team will restructure the content and publications on the Facebook
fanpage (BeLi English) to attract customers. Viva Team will also design and rework the content
on the website to create brand uniformity, provide complete information and images, making it
convenient to reach target customers. For BeLi English's event, our team will deploy a
communication strategy on social networking platforms to reach the largest target audience.
Finally, the Viva team proposes to produce TVC - a video introducing and advertising BeLi
English, with concise, consistent brand content, clearly demonstrating the core values and culture
of BeLi English.

1.1. Brand Identity Management
1.1.1. Production Schedule







1.1.2. Work Assignment



1.1.3. Website
1.1.3.1. Website Content



1.1.3.2. Website Interface
1.1.3.2.1 BeLi English’s old website

BeLi English's old website faces several issues. Firstly, being a single-page site, it fails to meet
the criteria for an official website, providing a limited and non-comprehensive user experience.
The content is poorly organized, making it challenging for users to find information and
understand academic programs logically. Additionally, the use of photos with unknown origins
poses a risk to the website's reputation and may create a negative impression on visitors. Lastly,
the old website lacks clear categorization of study programs, making it difficult for potential
customers to fully grasp the learning opportunities offered, thus hindering the ability to attract
and retain the target audience.

BeLi English’s Old Website: link

http://belischool.com/


BeLi English old website

1.1.3.2.1 BeLi English’s new website

BeLi English's new website, created by the Viva Team, marks a substantial improvement over its
predecessor. The modern design and clear brand identity, featuring a new logo and colors,
address past issues. Notable enhancements include detailed content, user-friendly publications
with actual center images, and optimized registration forms on all pages. This comprehensive
upgrade not only promotes the brand effectively but also ensures a positive and engaging
experience for customers.

BeLi English's new website: link

https://belienglish.com/


BeLi English new website

1.1.4. Logo

1.1.4.1 BeLi English's old logo
BeLi English's old logo was designed with a two-part layout: image and text. The image has a
big letter "B" in the middle with a circle surrounding it with a line. Inside the circle are images
that represent diamonds. This is not consistent with the core values that BeLi wants to bring for
customers; it is "Affordable Price". On the other hand, the diamond pattern has many color bands
that are not highly aesthetic and make it difficult to combine with other media publications. The
letter "B" in the image inside the logo is in a large, round font while the text layout below uses a
thinner font so the brand name "BeLi English" does not stand out. Finally, this old logo only has
one version, making it difficult to design multi publications when inserting the logo.



BeLi English’s old logo

1.1.4.1 BeLi English's new logo
The BeLi English logo concept development encompasses various elements, each contributing to
the overall symbolism and representation of the brand.

- Shape: The circular form of the logo retains its original shape but undergoes stylization
by incorporating two circles with a small tail, enhancing its aesthetic appeal. The circular
shape can also represent unity, continuity, and the holistic nature of education provided
by BeLi.

- Letter B: The letter "B" within the circle is stylized with an upward curve, symbolizing
growth and development. This curve signifies progress not only in learning English but
also in various aspects of life.

- Text: The text component of the logo employs a sans-serif font that communicates
modernity, creativity, and flexibility. The choice of a slightly fat font adds a touch of
stability to the text, ensuring visibility and making "BeLi English" prominently stand out.
This choice not only enhances readability but also conveys a sense of reliability and
strength.



BeLi English’s new logo

1.1.5. TVC

BeLi English's TVC, developed over six weeks, strategically focuses on promoting the message
"Learn the most, no worries about cost" (Học vui hết ý, không lo chi phí) to increase brand
awareness and attract target customers. The detailed content covers various aspects of the center,
including facilities, curriculum, student achievements, cultural aspects, teaching methods, and
staff dedication. Real feedback from students and parents enhances credibility. The TVC visually
emphasizes an affordable, engaging, and enjoyable learning experience, featuring bright colors,
an open space, diverse characters, and the BeLi English team. The key message centers on BeLi's
core values of affordability, enjoyable learning, and guaranteed quality outcomes, encapsulated
in the slogan "Learn the most, no worries about cost." (See Appendix 6)
​

1.1.5.1. Production Timeline







1.2. Media Platform Development
1.2.1. Content Line (See Appendix 7)







1.2.2. Media Schedule



1.3. Offline Event Assistance
BeLi English Center's event that complements clients' additional requests. This emphasizes that
the event is not only an opportunity to interact and connect with students, but also an element
that brings added value to the learning experience. Viva Team is mainly responsible for
supporting the event, instead of organizing the event directly. We create ideas, organizational and
technical support within the allowable framework, multi-platform media communication before
and after all events, thereby strengthening relationships and creating experiences. positive for
customers.

1.3.1. Event Schedule



1.3.2. Event 1: Extracurricular experience at Erahouse science park

1.3.3. Event 2: Promotional Events at preschools



1.3.4. Event 3: English olympic golden bell ringing Event

1.3.5. Event 4: “Foreigner Hunting” Event on Hoan Kiem Lake walking
street

1.3.6. Event 5: Mid-autumn Festival Event



1.3.7. Event 6: Halloween Event

2. BSTUDY PLAN IMPLEMENTATION
Viva Team aims to promote Bstudy effectively to educational institutions, English centers, and
instructors. Their comprehensive strategy involves restructuring content on the Bstudy Việt Nam
Facebook fanpage to create an official and attractive communication channel. Additionally, the
introduction of a mascot aims to enhance brand recognition. To diversify communication, a new
Instagram channel (tienganh_allday) will be established.

For direct promotion, the team plans to create a professional company profile that provides
detailed information about Bstudy's products, services, and capabilities. This profile serves as a



valuable document to leave a positive impression on partners and customers, highlighting
Bstudy's professionalism and reputation in the education industry.

2.1. Brand Identity Management
2.1.1. Our Production Schedule





2.1.2. Work Assignment

2.1.3. Mascot
The Bstudy Mascot combines the imagery of a "tree sprout" and a "superhero cape" to represent
effective support in the educational environment. It symbolizes Bstudy's commitment to being a
reliable companion for teachers in organizing and managing teaching methods, while also
fostering excitement and curiosity in students' learning. The Mascot serves as a source of
encouragement and motivation, working towards the common goal of improving education
quality and promoting comprehensive student development. (See Appendix 10)



2.1.4. Company Profile

Link Company Profile

https://drive.google.com/file/d/1ie-tnHLth_AqBj4Y9M6aGe_oXqdbDEJV/view?usp=sharing


2.2. Media Platform Development (See Appendix 9)
2.2.1. Content Line







2.2.2. Media Schedule
2.2.2.1. Bstudy Facebook Page

2.2.2.2. Bstudy Instagram Account (See Appendix 10)







3. TOTAL PROJECT BUDGET
When evaluating Better Life's communication campaign, although precise cost details may
remain confidential, we can still analyze the general cost distribution across various campaign
elements. The effectiveness of the campaign does not solely rely on cost figures but rather on
how effectively the budget was utilized to meet the campaign's objectives. The main objective
should be assessing the efficiency of each activity, channel, or initiative in terms of
cost-effectiveness within the campaign.



CHAPTER 5. PROJECT EVALUATION

1. BELI ENGLISH COMMUNICATION EFFECTIVENESS
In the case of BeLi English, a comprehensive evaluation across various categories, including
social media metrics, website performance, and the impact of TV commercials, provides insights
into the success of their communication strategies. BeLi English's communication strategies
have proven to be highly effective across various platforms, demonstrating strong engagement on
social media and a positive trend in website interactions. This comprehensive assessment
provides valuable insights for refining and enhancing future communication strategies to further
bolster BeLi English's online presence and engagement.





1.1. BeLi English Facebook Page
One of the key indicators of online presence is the reach of a Facebook page. BeLi English has
not only met but exceeded its target, boasting a reach of 14,932 compared to the set goal of
12,000. This surpassing figure signifies a robust online presence and effective content
distribution during the specified evaluation period. Furthermore, audience engagement on the
Facebook page has been remarkable, with interactions reaching 4,700 reactions against the target
of 3,500. The growth of the Facebook community has also been promising, as the actual result
for new page likes stands at 811, surpassing the initial goal of 500. The platform has successfully
garnered interest and engagement, exemplified by the exceeded target of 6,684 visits against the
goal of 5,000.

1.2. Website Performance
BeLi English has demonstrated a heightened interest in its content, with a search volume of 590
per month, surpassing the target of 450. The rates of keyword searches for both information and
transactions have witnessed improvement, moving from 40% to 50%. This uptick in
effectiveness suggests that the website is adept at providing information and facilitating
transactions, contributing to a positive user experience. Monthly visits to the website have shown
a notable increase, reaching 129 against the set target of 100. The average visit duration has also
seen improvement, with visitors spending an average of 4:34 minutes on the site compared to the
previous duration of 3:30 minutes. Furthermore, the goal of three pages clicked per visit has been
exceeded, with visitors exploring an average of five pages per visit.

1.3. TVC Impact
Turning attention to the impact of TV commercials, the reach may have slightly missed the
target, but a substantial impression of 596 has been achieved against the goal of 700. The metrics
of interaction, likes, reactions, comments, and shares on social media in response to the TV
commercials all indicate positive engagement. Actual results either met or surpassed the targets,



suggesting that the TV commercials effectively captured audience attention and generated
meaningful interactions on social media platforms.

1.4. Target Audience Acknowledgment
The evaluation of BeLi English's communication effectiveness delves into the demographic
details of its Facebook page followers, shedding light on key factors that influence our outreach
strategy. Among the age groups, individuals aged 25-34 constitute the largest proportion of the
audience, underscoring the appeal of BeLi English content to this particular demographic.
Following closely, subjects aged 35-44 years old represent another significant segment of the
follower base, indicating true to the campaign's goals.

Gender-wise, the Facebook page has garnered a notable female majority, with women accounting
for 69.5% of the total followers. The revelation that the predominant demographic on BeLi
English's Facebook page comprises women between the ages of 25-44 years old carries
significant implications for the understanding of the target audience. The choice to engage with
content from BeLi English may indicate a keen interest in finding a trustworthy and effective
English learning environment for their children.

Geographically, the data reveals that the provinces and cities with the highest concentration of
BeLi English Facebook page followers are Ho Chi Minh City and Hanoi, constituting 15% and
12.7% of the total audience, respectively. The strategic decision to prioritize article distribution
to audiences in Ho Chi Minh City is substantiated by the recent opening of a branch in this area.
The higher reach in Ho Chi Minh City, therefore, reflects a deliberate effort to prioritize and
cater to the growing community in that region.

2. BSTUDY COMMUNICATION EFFECTIVENESS
The evaluation of Bstudy's communication effectiveness on both Facebook and Instagram
platforms reveals a consistently positive performance across key metrics. The notable increases
in reach, interactions, and new followers signify an effective social media strategy that is
successfully engaging the audience and expanding the brand's online presence. This data-driven
assessment provides valuable insights for refining and optimizing future communication
strategies, ensuring continued success in reaching and resonating with the target audience.



2.1. Bstudy Facebook Page
In terms of reach, Bstudy has demonstrated a notable increase, achieving a reach of 1,964
compared to the target of 1,500 during the specified period from 27/7 to 9/12. This reflects a
commendable 130.93% performance against the set goal, indicating a successful expansion of
their audience and increased visibility on the Facebook platform. Interactions on the page have
also seen a significant uptick, with 2,500 reactions compared to the target of 2,000, representing
a remarkable 125% achievement. This heightened engagement suggests that Bstudy's content is
resonating well with its audience, fostering a dynamic and responsive community. The growth of
new Facebook page likes has been exceptional, surpassing the target of 500 and reaching 803,
showcasing a notable 160.6% achievement. Additionally, visits on Facebook have seen a
substantial increase, with 3,603 visits compared to the target of 3,000, representing a 120.1%
success rate. This surge in visits indicates a heightened interest and engagement with Bstudy's
content on the Facebook platform.

2.2. Bstudy Instagram Account
The evaluation extends to Bstudy's Instagram account, where the reach has witnessed a
commendable increase from 3,500 to 4,314 during the period from 9/9 to 9/12, achieving a
robust 123.58% of the set target. This growth in reach underscores the effectiveness of Bstudy's
Instagram strategy in expanding its audience and enhancing visibility on the platform.
Interactions on Instagram, measured through reactions, have exceeded expectations, with a total



of 112 reactions against the target of 100, demonstrating a noteworthy 112% success rate. The
acquisition of new followers on Instagram has also been positive, reaching 2,052 against the
target of 2,000, achieving a solid 102.6% success rate. This suggests that Bstudy's Instagram
content is resonating well with the audience and attracting new followers to the account.

2.3. Target Audience Acknowledgment
With a total of 1,516 followers, the data reveals a distinctive profile of Bstudy's audience. The
largest proportion of followers falls within the age range of 25-34, indicating a significant appeal
to individuals in this demographic. Notably, the 18-24 age group closely follows, underlining a
broad reach across young adults, potentially students and early professionals seeking educational
support.

In terms of gender distribution, Bstudy's audience is predominantly female, constituting 59.6%
of the total followers. Understanding the demographics allows Bstudy to create targeted and
resonant messaging that addresses the specific needs and expectations of this audience segment.

Geographically, Hanoi emerges as the primary area reaching the most target audiences. This
insight into the geographical distribution of followers enables Bstudy to refine its localization
strategies, ensuring that content and communications are tailored to suit the preferences and
nuances of the Hanoi audience.

Furthermore, the emphasis on connecting teachers with students adds a collaborative and
interactive dimension to the learning experience. This not only addresses the evolving
preferences of modern learners but also aligns with the contemporary dynamics of remote and
online education. The incorporation of features that simplify the homework assignment and
lesson correction process reflects a commitment to enhancing the overall user experience,
making Bstudy a comprehensive and user-friendly tool for language learners.

3. PROJECT CLIENT EVALUATION
Better Life's communication project is a success across various dimensions, owing to meticulous
goal-setting, adept use of media channels, and compelling content creation. The project
surpassed targets and serves as an inspiration for other organizations refining their
communication strategies. Commendations from the project owner, reflected in a perfect score of
10, acknowledge the team's dedication and creativity, particularly in enhancing brand awareness
on online platforms. This positive evaluation not only validates efforts but also exceeds
expectations, leaving a lasting impression on the target audience and stakeholders.

The staff's evaluation of the VIVA team provides valuable insights into the impact on employee
development and overall communication strategy enhancement. Understanding the team's



modus operandi aligns employees with organizational goals, and the shift from spontaneous to
planned initiatives signifies strategic evolution. Recognition of receiving full training
underscores the team's commitment to comprehensive employee development, fostering a
versatile and adaptable workforce capable of navigating contemporary communication
landscapes.

In essence, Better Life's communication project showcases strategic execution, creative
excellence, and team dedication, with the positive evaluation affirming its effectiveness and
meaningful impact within and beyond the organization.



4. INTERNAL AUDIT OF VIVA TEAM



CHAPTER 6. PROJECT REFLECTION

1. POSITIVE KEY POINTS
The comprehensive implementation of the communication campaign for Better Life
Organization stands as a testament to the project team's prowess, resulting in a cascade of
positive reflections that extend far beyond the initial expectations. The campaign has not only
achieved remarkable milestones but has also laid the groundwork for a lasting legacy and
positioned the organization to harness substantial potential in future endeavors.

A standout accomplishment is the campaign's resounding success in surpassing the
predetermined Key Performance Indicators (KPIs). The ability to exceed KPIs underscores the
team's effectiveness in navigating challenges and optimizing resources for maximum impact.

Through adept allocation of responsibilities, they orchestrated a symphony of tasks with
remarkable precision and speed. This accomplishment reflects not only their individual
competencies but also the team's cohesion, coordination, and shared dedication to excellence in
project execution.

In the short term, the team showcased exceptional productivity by generating a substantial
volume of engaging posts across various fanpage channels, including Beli, Bstudy, and
Instagram (Bstudy). The ability to sustain such engagement demonstrates the team's agility and
capacity to deliver immediate, tangible results, fostering a connection with the target audience.

The team exhibited creativity and expertise in revamping the logo, color set, TV commercial,
mascot, website, and business profile. This comprehensive overhaul reflects a forward-thinking
approach, ensuring that these elements are not merely visually appealing but also strategically
aligned with Better Life Organization's brand identity for sustained, long-term use. This legacy
will serve as a robust foundation for the organization's future communication efforts, projecting a
cohesive and enduring brand image.

The project team's dedication and attention to detail, evident in achieving both short-term and
long-term objectives, have positioned Better Life Organization for sustained success in
enhancing brand awareness and engagement. Their collective efforts have fortified the
organization's standing in the competitive landscape, setting the stage for continued growth and
impact in the realm of communication campaigns.



2. PROJECT LIMITATIONS
While the implementation of the communication campaign for Better Life Organization has seen
numerous positive outcomes, it is essential to acknowledge areas where the project team
encountered challenges, leading to negative reflections on certain aspects of the campaign.

One notable setback involves occasional delays in progress compared to the original plan.
Although these delays did not significantly impact the overall project, they represent a point of
concern, indicating potential areas for improvement in project management and timeline
adherence. The team's ability to address these delays effectively will be crucial in optimizing
future project timelines and ensuring a more seamless execution.

In the context of website development, there is a notable gap in the completion of the recruitment
section. The business's busyness and the consequent delay in providing necessary content have
impeded the team's progress in finalizing this section. This underscores the interdependence of
different elements within the project, where delays in one area can cascade and affect other
components. Addressing this issue necessitates improved communication and collaboration
between the project team and the business stakeholders.

In conclusion, while the communication campaign has seen significant achievements, addressing
these negative reflections is vital for continuous improvement. Proactive measures, including
refining project management processes, enhancing responsiveness to urgent requests, improving
communication with business stakeholders, and addressing research-related challenges, will
contribute to overcoming these setbacks and fortifying the project team's overall effectiveness.

3. LESSONS LEARNED FROM THE PROJECT
Reflecting on the positive and negative aspects of the communication campaign for Better Life
Organization, the project team has garnered valuable insights that serve as lessons learned for
future endeavors. These reflections provide a roadmap for improvement and optimization in
various aspects of project execution.

One significant lesson learned from the positive reflections is the need to arrange time and plans
more reasonably to prevent the occurrence of delays. While the team demonstrated efficiency
and achieved numerous milestones, occasional setbacks were noted in terms of adhering to the
original timeline. To address this, future projects will benefit from a more meticulous approach
to time management, ensuring that tasks are allocated with realistic deadlines and that the team
maintains a proactive stance in meeting them.



In conclusion, the positive and negative reflections have served as valuable sources of learning
for the project team. The identified lessons, including the need for improved time management,
clear agreements on urgent deadlines, thorough website editing, and a balanced allocation of
resources, will guide the team towards more effective and efficient project execution in the
future. These insights contribute to the continuous growth and refinement of the team's
capabilities in delivering successful communication campaigns.

4. OUR RECOMMENDATIONS
Reflecting on the completed communication campaign for Better Life Organization, the project
team has compiled a set of recommendations aimed at propelling the project to new heights in
the upcoming phases. These recommendations are designed to address specific areas of
improvement and capitalize on opportunities for further development.

For BeLi English, the team proposes a more robust development of online tutoring courses and
online educational content. Recognizing the growing trend of online learning, this
recommendation aims to enhance BeLi's presence in the digital education space, providing
learners with accessible and high-quality courses. Additionally, the team suggests leveraging
Key Opinion Leaders (KOL) and Key Opinion Consumers (KOC) to create engaging videos
discussing the new courses. This strategy aligns with the contemporary marketing landscape,
where influencer collaborations can significantly impact brand visibility and credibility. To
amplify reach and engagement, the team recommends running targeted advertisements to drive
more traffic and data.

In the case of Bstudy, the team recommends diversifying the morphologies of the mascots
associated with the brand. This suggestion aims to create a more inclusive and relatable visual
identity, catering to a broader audience. To enhance credibility, the team proposes creating a
video featuring feedback from B-B customers, including school owners, center owners, and
teachers who have utilized the application. This user-generated content can be utilized in
advertising campaigns to build trust and authenticity. Expanding the reach further, the team
recommends booking newspapers for wider dissemination of Bstudy's initiatives. Moreover,
collaborating with well-known English teachers as Key Opinion Leaders or Key Opinion
Consumers is advised to strengthen communication about the app and enhance its market
position.
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